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At TS Global, we pride
ourselves on being a leading
name in the agricultural
export industry. Established
in 2023 and based in
Bhavnagar, India, we
specialize in providing high-
quality agricultural products
to global markets. With a
commitment to excellence
and a customer-centric
approach, TS Global has
quickly gained recognition
as a trusted supplier of
essential commodities. Our
portfolio includes premium
pulses, fresh and dehydrated
onions and garlic, rice,
maize, millets, and other
agricultural products.Our
dedication to quality and
sustainability has earned us
the prestigious APEDA.
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Contact Us
Office No. 126, Madhav
Darshan, Bhavnagar

tsglobal.info2023@gmail.com
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